

BID INVITATION 2019-05 PESTICIDES REVISED
July 29, 2019 @ 2:00 p.m.

PRODUCT	QUANTITY TOTAL	Adapco	Clarke	SiteOne	Target	Univar	Wilbur Ellis
Advion	10,000 Lbs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 102,279.80	NO BID	NO BID
Altosid Briquettes	400 Units	NO BID	WRONG QUOTE	NO BID	\$ 517.65	\$ 517.65	NO BID
Altosid XR Briquettes	440 Units	NO BID	WRONG QUOTE	NO BID	\$ 1,636.47	\$ 1,636.47	NO BID
Altosid Pellets	3,000 Lbs	NO BID	WRONG QUOTE	NO BID	\$ 83,134.60	\$ 83,134.60	NO BID
AquaBac 200G	3,200 Lbs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 7,251.45	BID RESCINDED	NO BID
Demand CS	10 Gal	NO BID	\$ 765.28	NO BID	\$ 4,750.20	\$ 5,709.38	NO BID
Evergreen ULV (5-25) Ground	55 Gal	\$ 10,363.71	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 10,326.67	\$ 9,934.26	NO BID
Extinguish Plus	18,000 Lbs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 124,200.00	\$ 118,820.25	NO BID

I hereby certify that the above table represents the bids received [July 29th, 2019](#).

Abby Torres

Abby Torres, Accounting Technician I

Roberta Dieckman

Roberta Dieckmann, Interim Operations Manager

Lowest Bid
Tied Bid

PESTICIDE SUBSTITUTION
