

REQUEST FOR QUOTES 2022-02 PESTICIDES  
 July 14, 2022 @ 2:00 p.m.

PRODUCT	QUANTITY TOTAL		Adapco LLC		Clarke		Target Specialty Products	
			QUOTE	NOTE(S)	QUOTE	NOTE(S)	QUOTE	NOTE(S)
Advion	3,000	lbs.		No Bid		No Bid	43,786.68	
Altosid Briquets	800	units		No Bid	1,087.50		1,087.50	
Altosid P-35	520	lbs.		No Bid	10,586.16		10,586.15	
AquaBac 200G	3,200	lbs.		No Bid		No Bid	9,613.50	
Aqua-Reslin	120	gals.		No Bid		No Bid	18,531.00	220 gals. \$36,540.00 360 gals. \$54,027.00
Duet	110	gals.		No Bid	26,739.78			No Bid
Evergreen ULV (5-25)	110	gals.	21,257.36	5 Gal pails - please call for availability before ordering		No Bid	25,527.90	
Extinguish Plus	9,000	lbs.		No Bid		No Bid	84,058.98	
Fyfanon ULV	7.5	gals.	636.84			No Bid		No Bid
Natular 2EC	20	gals.		No Bid	31,265.45			No Bid
Natular Censor	8,400	lbs.		No Bid	40,929.37			No Bid
Natular G	500	lbs.		No Bid	4,665.55	Quote is for 520 lbs.		No Bid
Natular G30	1,000	lbs.		No Bid	19,585.88			No Bid
Sunset Odor Reduction Technology Oil	1	gals.	589.98			No Bid		No Bid
VectoBac 12AS	300	gals.	14,110.31			No Bid		No Bid
VectoBac G	3,200	lbs.	9,570.00			No Bid		No Bid
VectoBac WDG	5,900	lbs.	218,152.50			No Bid		No Bid
VectoMax FG	1,600	lbs.	15,694.80			No Bid		No Bid
			\$ 280,011.79		\$ 134,859.69		\$ 193,191.71	

I hereby certify, the above table represents the bids received July 14th, 2022.

  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 Veronica Montoya, Payroll Coordinator

  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 Gregorio Alvarado, Field Supervisor

Lowest Bid
Tied Bid
Sole Source Product

REQUEST FOR QUOTES 2022-02 PESTICIDES  
 July 14, 2022 @ 2:00 p.m.

PRODUCT	QUANTITY TOTAL		Adapco LLC		Clarke		Target Specialty Products	
			QUOTE	NOTE(S)	QUOTE	NOTE(S)	QUOTE	NOTE(S)
Advion	3,000	lbs.		No Bid		No Bid	43,786.68	
Altosid Briquets	800	units		No Bid	1,087.50		1,087.50	
Altosid P-35	520	lbs.		No Bid	10,586.16		10,586.15	
AquaBac 200G	3,200	lbs.		No Bid		No Bid	9,613.50	
Aqua-Reslin	120	gals.		No Bid		No Bid	18,531.00	220 gals \$36,540.00 360 gals. \$54,027.00
Duet	110	gals.		No Bid	26,739.78			No Bid
Evergreen ULV (5-25)	110	gals.	21,257.36	5 Gal pails - please call for availability before ordering		No Bid	25,527.90	
Extinguish Plus	9,000	lbs.		No Bid		No Bid	84,058.98	
Fyfanon ULV	7.5	gals.	636.84			No Bid		No Bid
Natular 2EC	20	gals.		No Bid	31,265.45			No Bid
Natular Censor	8,400	lbs.		No Bid	40,929.37			No Bid
Natular G	500	lbs.		No Bid	4,665.55	Quote is for 520 lbs.		No Bid
Natular G30	1,000	lbs.		No Bid	19,585.88			No Bid
Sunset Odor Reduction Technology Oil	1	gals.	589.98			No Bid		No Bid
VectoBac 12AS	300	gals.	14,110.31			No Bid		No Bid
VectoBac G	3,200	lbs.	9,570.00			No Bid		No Bid
VectoBac WDG	5,900	lbs.	218,152.50			No Bid		No Bid
VectoMax FG	1,600	lbs.	15,694.80			No Bid		No Bid
			\$ 280,011.79		\$ 134,859.69		\$ 193,191.71	

I hereby certify, the above table represents the bids received [July 14th, 2022](#).

*Veronica Montoya*

Veronica Montoya, Payroll Coordinator

*Gregorio Alvarado*

Gregorio Alvarado, Field Supervisor

Lowest Bid
Tied Bid
Sole Source Product